
Paper Plate 

Easter Art

what you will need:

How to:

Paper Plates White 
50pk - Large

SKU: 115050
$8.95

BUY BULK AND SAVE

Pipe Cleaners 100pk
Assorted Colours 
300mm
 
SKU: 111139
$5.50

Round Joggle Glue 
On Eyes 100pk 15mm

SKU: 111030
$7.50

Construction Paper 
Recycled 100gsm
A4 Assorted 120pk

SKU: 114100
$8.95

Paper plates make the perfect Easter craft that your kids will 
enjoy because they’re so easy!

To Make Bunny Faces:

1. Take 3 pipe cleaners and twist them around each other in 
the center so that they are connected/stuck together. The 
part you twist is the hidden part that will go under the nose 
(button). This will leave you with the whiskers sticking out on 
both sides.

2. Glue the whiskers near the centre of the plate. Leave time 
to let dry as this step will require it to be glued well or the 
pipe cleaners will fall off. You may want to use other plates to 
weigh the pipe cleaners down, so they stick better.

3. Once the glue is dry from the pipe cleaners, now glue on 
your nose (button).

4. Round Joogle Glue On Eyes make the perfect eyes for this 
bunny. We decided to glue the eyes on, but you could also 
use construction paper and make the eyes yourself, or simply 
draw them onto the plate.

5. Draw and cut out some ears from white construction 
paper and then cut out a smaller inside ear with a different 
color. We chose pink and white to match the plate. You can 
staple, sticky tape or glue the ears on to the back of the 
paper plate.

6. Then use a black marker to draw the mouth or cut out a 
mouth with construction paper. Now you have a cute bunny! 

To Make Easter Eggs:

1. Draw or paint an egg shape onto the bottom of the plate. 
This will be your guide.

2. Pick and choose your favourite buttons to place on the egg 
shape. You can also create these egg shapes with pom poms 
so the design is up to you! It’s best to arrange them before 
getting the glue out.

3. Once you’re happy with the design, use some PVA glue 
and glue the buttons or pom poms individually to the plate. 
Alternatively, you can put glue over the top of your drawn 
egg shape and press the buttons or pom poms into the glue. 

4. Wait for the glue to dry - then you’re done! 

SHOP NOW SHOP NOW

SHOP NOW SHOP NOW SHOP NOW

Basic Bulk Buttons 
600g - Pastel Colours

SKU: 114702
$20.95

EC Pearl Junior 
Acrylic Paint 500ml 
Set of 6

SKU: 112638
$79.95

SHOP NOW
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